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Penetration testers simulate cyber attacks to find security weaknesses in networks, operating systems, and
applications. Information security experts worldwide use penetration techniques to evaluate enterprise
defenses.

In Penetration Testing, security expert, researcher, and trainer Georgia Weidman introduces you to the core
skills and techniques that every pentester needs. Using a virtual machine-based lab that includes Kali Linux
and vulnerable operating systems, you'll run through a series of practical lessons with tools like Wireshark,
Nmap, and Burp Suite. As you follow along with the labs and launch attacks, you'll experience the key
stages of an actual assessment - including information gathering, finding exploitable vulnerabilities, gaining
access to systems, post exploitation, and more.

Learn how to:

Crack passwords and wireless network keys with brute-forcing and wordlists●

Test web applications for vulnerabilities●

Use the Metasploit Framework to launch exploits and write your own Metasploit modules●

Automate social-engineering attacks●

Bypass antivirus software●

Turn access to one machine into total control of the enterprise in the post exploitation phase●

You'll even explore writing your own exploits. Then it's on to mobile hacking - Weidman's particular area of
research - with her tool, the Smartphone Pentest Framework.

With its collection of hands-on lessons that cover key tools and strategies, Penetration Testing is the
introduction that every aspiring hacker needs.
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From reader reviews:

Myra Lopez:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their particular reader with their
story or their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the books. But also they write about advantage
about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids, there are
many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on earth always try to improve their skill in writing,
they also doing some study before they write for their book. One of them is this Penetration Testing: A
Hands-On Introduction to Hacking.

Terry Matlock:

The book untitled Penetration Testing: A Hands-On Introduction to Hacking contain a lot of information on
this. The writer explains the girl idea with easy means. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do
certainly not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was authored by famous author. The author will
bring you in the new age of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can keep reading
your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to
purchase the e-book, you can open up their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice study.

Darlene Beaudoin:

That guide can make you to feel relax. That book Penetration Testing: A Hands-On Introduction to Hacking
was colourful and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Penetration Testing: A Hands-On
Introduction to Hacking has many kinds or style. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or
Detective Conan you can read and think you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book usually
are make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and unwind. Try to choose the best book for you and
try to like reading which.

Betsy Haley:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is different. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the top
book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is identified as of book
Penetration Testing: A Hands-On Introduction to Hacking. You can include your knowledge by it. Without
making the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most essential
that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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