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Un libro lleno de amor y de humor que reconstruye, desde la evocación, la vida, la felicidad añorada y
los espacios más queridos de Isabel Allende.

Amor por Chile y una gran nostalgia son el origen de este libro: la presencia continuada del pasado, el
sentimiento de verse ausente de la patria, la conciencia de haber sido peregrina y forastera... todo ello lo
transmite Isabel Allende con inteligencia y humor.

Aquí Chile deviene un país real y fantástico a la vez; una tierra estoica y hospitalaria, de hombres machistas
y mujeres fuertes y apegadas a la tierra. Pero, sobre todo, es el escenario de su niñez. Evocados con gracia,
cobran vida de nuevo su original familia, la casa de los abuelos, el ceremonial de las comidas, las historias de
infidelidades... y los espíritus que siempre la han acompañado.

Reseña:
«Un libro que capta mi entera atención al exponer la relación de la autora con ese país suyo, inventado,
imaginario, ficcional, con la historia de su familia, que a su vez es memoria inventada, con su vocación de
escritora.»
Jorge Edwards
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From reader reviews:

Steven Bourg:

Now a day people that Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each info they get. How people have to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Looking at a book can
help men and women out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Mi país inventado (Spanish
Edition) book since this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this
book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Sara Jones:

This book untitled Mi país inventado (Spanish Edition) to be one of several books in which best seller in this
year, this is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy this
book in the book retailer or you can order it via online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you easier to read this book, because you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is
no reason to your account to past this e-book from your list.

Clarence Frey:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a book you will get new information since book is one of a number of ways to share the
information or even their idea. Second, reading through a book will make an individual more imaginative.
When you reading through a book especially fiction book the author will bring one to imagine the story how
the character types do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other folks. When you
read this Mi país inventado (Spanish Edition), you can tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours
book. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a guide.

Kari Hughes:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this Mi país inventado (Spanish Edition) e-
book written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that could be understand by anyone
who have read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and creating
skill only for eliminate your hunger then you still hesitation Mi país inventado (Spanish Edition) as good
book not merely by the cover but also by content. This is one publication that can break don't determine book
by its include, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your reading sixth
sense already told you so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.
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