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The Great War transformed the Middle East, bringing to an end four hundred years of Ottoman rule in Arab
lands while giving rise to the Middle East as we know it today. A century later, the experiences of ordinary
men and women during those calamitous years have faded from memory. A Land of Aching Hearts traverses
ethnic, class, and national borders to recover the personal stories of the civilians and soldiers who endured
this cataclysmic event.

Among those who suffered were the people of Greater Syria?comprising modern Syria, Lebanon, Jordan,
Israel, and Palestine?as well as the people of Turkey, Iraq, and Egypt. Beyond the shifting fortunes of the
battlefield, the region was devastated by a British and French naval blockade made worse by Ottoman war
measures. Famine, disease, inflation, and an influx of refugees were everyday realities. But the local
populations were not passive victims. Fawaz chronicles the initiative and resilience of civilian émigrés,
entrepreneurs, draft-dodgers, soldiers, villagers, and townsmen determined to survive the war as best they
could. The right mix of ingenuity and practicality often meant the difference between life and death.

The war’s aftermath proved bitter for many survivors. Nationalist aspirations were quashed as Britain and
France divided the Middle East along artificial borders that still cause resentment. The misery of the Great
War, and a profound sense of huge sacrifices made in vain, would color people’s views of politics and the
West for the century to come.
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From reader reviews:

Julius Montanez:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important usually. The book A Land of Aching Hearts: The Middle East in the
Great War was making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It
is rather advantages for you. The e-book A Land of Aching Hearts: The Middle East in the Great War is not
only giving you a lot more new information but also to get your friend when you truly feel bored. You can
spend your own personal spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship with the book A Land of
Aching Hearts: The Middle East in the Great War. You never truly feel lose out for everything in case you
read some books.

Brooke Jenkins:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be change about what going on or facts even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era which can be always change and advance. Some of
you maybe may update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems
coming to you is you don't know what kind you should start with. This A Land of Aching Hearts: The
Middle East in the Great War is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, since this
book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Anthony Hubbard:

The experience that you get from A Land of Aching Hearts: The Middle East in the Great War is a more
deep you rooting the information that hide inside words the more you get thinking about reading it. It does
not mean that this book is hard to comprehend but A Land of Aching Hearts: The Middle East in the Great
War giving you excitement feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in specific way that can
be understood by anyone who read that because the author of this e-book is well-known enough. That book
also makes your own vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go to you, both in
printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having this A Land of Aching Hearts: The Middle
East in the Great War instantly.

Jennifer Tomasini:

A lot of people said that they feel weary when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the idea
when they get a half elements of the book. You can choose the particular book A Land of Aching Hearts:
The Middle East in the Great War to make your own reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading
proficiency is developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to
study it and mingle the impression about book and studying especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to
like to wide open a book and learn it. Beside that the guide A Land of Aching Hearts: The Middle East in the
Great War can to be your brand-new friend when you're really feel alone and confuse using what must you're



doing of these time.
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