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A rich and seductive narrative of the powerful erotic pull the East has always had for the West—a pervasive
yet often ignored aspect of their long historical relationship—and a deep exploration of the intimate
connection between sex and power.

Richard Bernstein defines the East widely—northern Africa, the Middle East, Asia, the Pacific Islands—and
frames it as a place where sexual pleasure was not commonly associated with sin, as it was in the West, and
where a different sexual culture offered the Western men who came as conquerers and traders thrilling but
morally ambiguous opportunities that were mostly unavailable at home. Bernstein maps this erotic history
through a chronology of notable personalities. Here are some of Europe’s greatest literary personalities and
explorers: Marco Polo, writing on the harem of Kublai Khan; Gustave Flaubert, describing his dalliances
with Egyptian prostitutes (and the diseases he picked up along the way); and Richard Francis Burton,
adventurer, lothario, anthropologist—and translator of The Arabian Nights.

Here also are those figures less well-known but with stories no less captivating or surprising: Europeans
whose “temporary marriages” to Japanese women might have inspired Puccini’s Madama Butterfly; rare
visitors to the boudoirs of Chinese emperors in the Forbidden City; American G.I.s and journalists in
Vietnam discovering the sexual emoluments of postcolonial power; men attracted to the sex bazaars of
yesterday’s North Africa and the Thailand of today. And throughout, Bernstein explores the lives of those
women who suffered for or profited from the fantasies of Western men.

A remarkable work of history: as unexpected as it is lucid, and as provocative as it is brilliantly illuminating.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Spangler:

This The East, the West, and Sex: A History of Erotic Encounters are generally reliable for you who want to
be considered a successful person, why. The key reason why of this The East, the West, and Sex: A History
of Erotic Encounters can be on the list of great books you must have will be giving you more than just simple
reading through food but feed an individual with information that maybe will shock your before knowledge.
This book will be handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions in e-book and
printed kinds. Beside that this The East, the West, and Sex: A History of Erotic Encounters giving you an
enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that we realize it
useful in your day activity. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

David Unruh:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book so.
There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new information.
When you read a guide you will get new information because book is one of a number of ways to share the
information or their idea. Second, reading through a book will make an individual more imaginative. When
you looking at a book especially fictional works book the author will bring that you imagine the story how
the characters do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others. When you read this The
East, the West, and Sex: A History of Erotic Encounters, you are able to tells your family, friends and also
soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a guide.

Fatima Leonard:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family, or their
particular friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic
in the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your current free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book can be option to fill your free time/
holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to try
look for book, may be the guide untitled The East, the West, and Sex: A History of Erotic Encounters can be
excellent book to read. May be it might be best activity to you.

Daniel Watkins:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you could
have it in e-book approach, more simple and reachable. This kind of The East, the West, and Sex: A History
of Erotic Encounters can give you a lot of buddies because by you checking out this one book you have
factor that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. That book can be one of one step for
you to get success. This e-book offer you information that might be your friend doesn't know, by knowing
more than some other make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? We should have The East, the West, and
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