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This coloring book from the British VOGUE has been created by award-winning writer, fashion editor,
curator and Royal College of Art Professor, Iain R Webb.

The hand-drawn artworks are inspired by iconic images from British VOGUE in the 1950s - an era of hats
and matching gloves, haughty elegance and hourglass silhouettes (a period that continues to inspire
contemporary designers including Miuccia Prada and Dolce & Gabbana).

The book features a glamorous dream wardrobe of luxurious ballgowns and soigné cocktail dresses, smart
suits and dramatic accessories by key designers including Christian Dior, Balenciaga, Givenchy and Chanel.
The accompanying captions offer fashion and style tips (often highly amusing in hindsight) and are taken
from the original pages of VOGUE. The c90 artworks can be coloured in in the spirit of the original images
that inspired them or embellished with whatever colors and patterns take the reader's fancy. The coloring
book is the perfect present for all those who love vintage fashion.
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From reader reviews:

Teddy Hathorn:

In other case, little persons like to read book Vogue Coloring Book. You can choose the best book if you
appreciate reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important any book Vogue Coloring Book.
You can add know-how and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, because from
book you can realize everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you will be known.
About simple matter until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or even
searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel bored to go to the library.
Let's read.

Allison Stiffler:

This Vogue Coloring Book are generally reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why.
The reason of this Vogue Coloring Book can be one of many great books you must have will be giving you
more than just simple examining food but feed anyone with information that probably will shock your
preceding knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your
conditions in e-book and printed types. Beside that this Vogue Coloring Book giving you an enormous of
experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your
day task. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Kathy Natal:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book than can
satisfy your short time to read it because all this time you only find guide that need more time to be study.
Vogue Coloring Book can be your answer since it can be read by you who have those short spare time
problems.

Glenda Rogers:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, paper, book,
and soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The particular book
that recommended for you is Vogue Coloring Book this e-book consist a lot of the information in the
condition of this world now. This specific book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The
terminology styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some
investigation when he makes this book. This is why this book acceptable all of you.
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