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Not only one of the twentieth century’s most inventive writers of supernatural fiction and author of such
masterpieces as The Willows and The Wendigo, Algernon Blackwood was also an indefatigable traveler, an
extremely popular storyteller on radio and television (he appeared on the first British television program
ever), and a secret agent during the First World War. Added to that, it was Algernon Blackwood, not Andrew
Lloyd Webber, who originated the Starlight Express. A Buddhist and theosophist as well as a member of the
Order of the Golden Dawn, Blackwood consorted with mystics and magicians, who knew him as Pan, while
those who delighted in his rich storyteller’s voice and lively humor affectionately called him Uncle Paul.
Some saw him as an ancient child, others as an accomplished athlete. He found time meanwhile to hobnob
with the literary establishment—with the likes of Hilaire Belloc, P. G. Wodehouse, Compton Mackenzie, and
H. G. Wells—and his work inspired writers as diverse as Henry Miller and Carlos Casteneda. Yet the story
of this fascinating, charming, elusive, and enigmatic man’s life has never before been told. More than twenty
years of research and countless interviews with friends and colleagues of the extraordinary Algernon
Blackwood, as well as a close examination of his unpublished papers, stand behind this first full-length
biography of a writer who, according to The Penguin Encyclopedia of Horror and the Supernatural,
“delivered a greater number of magisterial shudders than more refined writers in the genre ever attempted.”
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From reader reviews:

Tara Carlson:

Do you one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys
this particular aren't like that. This Algernon Blackwood: An Extraordinary Life book is readable through
you who hate those straight word style. You will find the info here are arrange for enjoyable studying
experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer involving
Algernon Blackwood: An Extraordinary Life content conveys the thought easily to understand by lots of
people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different such as it. So , do you
nonetheless thinking Algernon Blackwood: An Extraordinary Life is not loveable to be your top record
reading book?

Floyd Lipp:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading through you can get
a lot of information which will give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world may
share their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader
with their story or even their experience. Not only the story that share in the books. But also they write about
the data about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their
talent in writing, they also doing some research before they write with their book. One of them is this
Algernon Blackwood: An Extraordinary Life.

Charlie Seymour:

Is it a person who having spare time after that spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Algernon Blackwood: An Extraordinary
Life can be the response, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your
spare time by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than
the others?

Todd Apperson:

That book can make you to feel relax. This book Algernon Blackwood: An Extraordinary Life was colourful
and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Algernon Blackwood: An Extraordinary Life has
many kinds or category. Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can
read and think that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are usually make you bored,
any it makes you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like
reading which.
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