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Everyone has secrets, but some can change your life forever…

Diana Grant does not fawn over celebrities. She has always been a quiet, serious type of person. A budding
anthropologist, she is interested in facts. Not romantic ideals. She finds it odd then that, ever since she saw a
picture of Catahasa Yazzie, the young billionaire CEO of a property company in New Mexico, she’s felt
herself inexplicably drawn to him.

She finds it even odder that, when she accepts a temporary position at his company's headquarters, he seems
equally drawn to her. What Diana doesn’t know is that her new boss has a secret. A secret with roots that go
back to an ancient civilization older, perhaps, than time itself.

When the fruits of this secret reveal themselves to Diana, will she be able to survive the encounter?

★★★★★

"POWERFUL! Paula Knight creates an intensely romantic world for young and old alike. A place where
there is darkness and light, love and hope, and if you dare to go there you will never want to leave."

Read the complete novel by scrolling back up and clicking BUY NOW!
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From reader reviews:

Michael Wickham:

COUGAR ROMANCE: The Talisman (Paranormal BBW Menage Romance) (Secret Shades of the Alpha
Blood Series Book 1) can be one of your starter books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that
straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in language, easy
to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The article author giving his/her
effort to place every word into pleasure arrangement in writing COUGAR ROMANCE: The Talisman
(Paranormal BBW Menage Romance) (Secret Shades of the Alpha Blood Series Book 1) yet doesn't forget
the main stage, giving the reader the hottest and based confirm resource details that maybe you can be
considered one of it. This great information can drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial pondering.

Marie Michael:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this COUGAR ROMANCE: The
Talisman (Paranormal BBW Menage Romance) (Secret Shades of the Alpha Blood Series Book 1)
publication written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that could be understand
by anyone who have read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas
and producing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still doubt COUGAR ROMANCE: The
Talisman (Paranormal BBW Menage Romance) (Secret Shades of the Alpha Blood Series Book 1) as good
book not just by the cover but also with the content. This is one book that can break don't evaluate book by
its deal with, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your studying
sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

John Masterson:

Beside this particular COUGAR ROMANCE: The Talisman (Paranormal BBW Menage Romance) (Secret
Shades of the Alpha Blood Series Book 1) in your phone, it can give you a way to get closer to the new
knowledge or information. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh from the oven so
don't be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have COUGAR
ROMANCE: The Talisman (Paranormal BBW Menage Romance) (Secret Shades of the Alpha Blood Series
Book 1) because this book offers for you readable information. Do you often have book but you rarely get
what it's all about. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable
arrangement here cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to
miss that? Find this book along with read it from currently!

Jose Garcia:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you will get it
in e-book technique, more simple and reachable. This COUGAR ROMANCE: The Talisman (Paranormal
BBW Menage Romance) (Secret Shades of the Alpha Blood Series Book 1) can give you a lot of close



friends because by you looking at this one book you have issue that they don't and make an individual more
like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of a step for you to get success. This book offer you
information that perhaps your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than other make you to be great
individuals. So , why hesitate? Let us have COUGAR ROMANCE: The Talisman (Paranormal BBW
Menage Romance) (Secret Shades of the Alpha Blood Series Book 1).
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