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Sequential Experimentation in Clinical Trials: Design and Analysis is developed from decades of work in
research groups, statistical pedagogy, and workshop participation. Different parts of the book can be used for
short courses on clinical trials, translational medical research, and sequential experimentation. The authors
have successfully used the book to teach innovative clinical trial designs and statistical methods for Statistics
Ph.D. students at Stanford University. There are additional online supplements for the book that include
chapter-specific exercises and information.

Sequential Experimentation in Clinical Trials: Design and Analysis covers the much broader subject of
sequential experimentation that includes group sequential and adaptive designs of Phase II and III clinical
trials, which have attracted much attention in the past three decades. In particular, the broad scope of design
and analysis problems in sequential experimentation clearly requires a wide range of statistical methods and
models from nonlinear regression analysis, experimental design, dynamic programming, survival analysis,
resampling, and likelihood and Bayesian inference. The background material in these building blocks is
summarized in Chapter 2 and Chapter 3 and certain sections in Chapter 6 and Chapter 7. Besides group
sequential tests and adaptive designs, the book also introduces sequential change-point detection methods in
Chapter 5 in connection with pharmacovigilance and public health surveillance. Together with dynamic
programming and approximate dynamic programming in Chapter 3, the book therefore covers all basic
topics for a graduate course in sequential analysis designs.
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From reader reviews:

Lula Barnes:

The book Sequential Experimentation in Clinical Trials: Design and Analysis (Springer Series in Statistics)
can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. Exactly why
must we leave the best thing like a book Sequential Experimentation in Clinical Trials: Design and Analysis
(Springer Series in Statistics)? Some of you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim which book
can give many details for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or
facts that you take for that, you may give for each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book Sequential
Experimentation in Clinical Trials: Design and Analysis (Springer Series in Statistics) has simple shape but
you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can seem the enormous world by open and read a
publication. So it is very wonderful.

Maria Clyburn:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the subject Sequential
Experimentation in Clinical Trials: Design and Analysis (Springer Series in Statistics) suitable to you? The
actual book was written by popular writer in this era. The particular book untitled Sequential
Experimentation in Clinical Trials: Design and Analysis (Springer Series in Statistics)is the one of several
books which everyone read now. This specific book was inspired a number of people in the world. When
you read this book you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know previous to. The author explained
their thought in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this guide. This
book will give you a lots of information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world
with this book.

Katherine Velasquez:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got pupils? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And you also
know that little person similar to reading or as studying become their hobby. You have to know that reading
is very important in addition to book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to add you knowledge,
except your teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update in relation to something by book. A substantial
number of sorts of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is niagra Sequential
Experimentation in Clinical Trials: Design and Analysis (Springer Series in Statistics).

Lillian Kea:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a publication. They are directly felt it when they
get a half parts of the book. You can choose the book Sequential Experimentation in Clinical Trials: Design
and Analysis (Springer Series in Statistics) to make your personal reading is interesting. Your skill of reading
proficiency is developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to study



it and mingle the impression about book and reading especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to wide
open a book and learn it. Beside that the e-book Sequential Experimentation in Clinical Trials: Design and
Analysis (Springer Series in Statistics) can to be a newly purchased friend when you're feel alone and
confuse with the information must you're doing of these time.
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