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It has been widely recognized nowadays the importance of introducing mathematical models that take into
account possible sudden changes in the dynamical behavior of a high-integrity systems or a safety-critical
system. Such systems can be found in aircraft control, nuclear power stations, robotic manipulator systems,
integrated communication networks and large-scale flexible structures for space stations, and are inherently
vulnerable to abrupt changes in their structures caused by component or interconnection failures. In this
regard, a particularly interesting class of models is the so-called Markov jump linear systems (MJLS), which
have been used in numerous applications including robotics, economics and wireless communication.
Combining probability and operator theory, the present volume provides a unified and rigorous treatment of
recent results in control theory of continuous-time MJLS. This unique approach is of great interest to experts
working in the field of linear systems with Markovian jump parameters or in stochastic control. The volume
focuses on one of the few cases of stochastic control problems with an actual explicit solution and offers
material well-suited to coursework, introducing students to an interesting and active research area.

The book is addressed to researchers working in control and signal processing engineering. Prerequisites
include a solid background in classical linear control theory, basic familiarity with continuous-time Markov
chains and probability theory, and some elementary knowledge of operator theory. ?
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From reader reviews:

Beverly Dewitt:

Typically the book Continuous-Time Markov Jump Linear Systems (Probability and Its Applications) will
bring someone to the new experience of reading a book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique.
If you try to find new book to read, this book very ideal to you. The book Continuous-Time Markov Jump
Linear Systems (Probability and Its Applications) is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the
e-book from the official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

James Dorman:

The guide untitled Continuous-Time Markov Jump Linear Systems (Probability and Its Applications) is the
book that recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown
to a person. The language that writer use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand.
The article author was did a lot of analysis when write the book, to ensure the information that they share for
your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book of Continuous-Time
Markov Jump Linear Systems (Probability and Its Applications) from the publisher to make you more enjoy
free time.

Daniel Gomez:

Continuous-Time Markov Jump Linear Systems (Probability and Its Applications) can be one of your
beginning books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this publication has
good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but
nonetheless delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her effort to place every word into delight
arrangement in writing Continuous-Time Markov Jump Linear Systems (Probability and Its Applications)
yet doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource info that
maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information can certainly drawn you into brand-new stage
of crucial considering.

Anna Chew:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book had been rare?
Why so many issue for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people
likes studying, not only science book but also novel and Continuous-Time Markov Jump Linear Systems
(Probability and Its Applications) or maybe others sources were given expertise for you. After you know
how the fantastic a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or
students especially. Those guides are helping them to put their knowledge. In different case, beside science
publication, any other book likes Continuous-Time Markov Jump Linear Systems (Probability and Its
Applications) to make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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