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Read the first page and kiss the next 24 hours goodbye. Bravo!" --Jeffery Deaver, internationally
bestselling author of The Skin Collector

"Big Breakout Author" for February 2015 --Library Journal

Everyone in the quiet Jersey Shore town of Silver Bay knows the story: on a Sunday evening in September
1991, Ramsey Miller threw a blowout block party, then murdered his beautiful wife and three-year-old
daughter. 

But everyone is wrong. The daughter got away. Now she is nearly eighteen and tired of living in secrecy.
Under the name Melanie Denison, she has spent the last fifteen years in small-town West Virginia as part of
the Witness Protection Program. She has never been allowed to travel, go to a school dance, or even have
internet at home. Precautions must be taken at every turn, because Ramsey Miller was never caught and
might still be looking for his daughter. Yet despite strict house rules, Melanie has entered into a relationship
with a young teacher at the local high school and is now ten weeks pregnant. She doesn't want her child to
live in hiding as she has had to. Defying her guardians and taking matters into her own hands, Melanie
returns to Silver Bay in hopes of doing what the authorities have failed to do: find her father before he finds
her. Weaving in Ramsey's story in the three days leading up to the brutal crime, Before He Finds Her is a
stirring novel about love and faith and fear--and how the most important things can become terribly distorted
when we cling to them too fiercely.
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From reader reviews:

Bettie Hentges:

What do you concerning book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what yours problem? How about your time? Or are you busy particular person? If you
don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have extra
time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They should answer that question
mainly because just their can do in which. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it
is proper. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this particular Before He Finds Her: A
Novel to read.

Victor Loy:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading habit give
you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside
the book that will improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want truly feel
happy read one using theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Often the Before He Finds Her: A
Novel is kind of publication which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Jacqueline Carter:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a reserve you will get new information mainly because book is one of many ways to
share the information or maybe their idea. Second, looking at a book will make anyone more imaginative.
When you examining a book especially fictional works book the author will bring someone to imagine the
story how the people do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other individuals. When you
read this Before He Finds Her: A Novel, you can tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours
guide. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a reserve.

Tommy Bowles:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book compared to can
satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all of this time you only find guide that need more time
to be read. Before He Finds Her: A Novel can be your answer given it can be read by anyone who have those
short extra time problems.
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