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"Much has been written both about and by people who feel they were assigned the wrong body at
conception, exploring the struggles and too often the tragedies that result from that mismatch of nature. Very
little has been written, however, to chronicle the lifelong struggle of people to understand and come to terms
with two distinct sets of emotions, one male and one female – a single soul, at times divided, at times united,
by two clearly identifiable spirits.

Dear Mom and Dad: You Don’t Know Me, But … traces the life of George through the eyes of Georgia, the
female half of their soul, from early childhood in the post war Texas oil fields through the innocence of his
early school years in northeastern Oklahoma. With the onset of puberty, Georgia watches the omnipresent
feeling of not being normal cast a destructive pall over nearly everything George attempts. After the collapse
of his lifelong dream, George begins again with hopes, new dreams and the love they’ve both longed for.
Georgia finally emerges, but understanding her part in their soul comes slowly and is complicated by a
tragedy of profound proportion.

Dear Mom and Dad considers the ultimate understanding of God’s will for both George and Georgia and its
unusual conclusion, sharing a story of struggle and self-acceptance."
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From reader reviews:

Alex Levey:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information today can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider while those information which is from the former life are challenging be find than now is taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you find
the unstable resource then you have it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Dear Mom and Dad: You Don't Know Me, But ... as
the daily resource information.

Jessica Garcia:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their down time with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, going to beach, or
picnic inside park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different
to fill your free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book is usually option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to
test look for book, may be the book untitled Dear Mom and Dad: You Don't Know Me, But ... can be great
book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Virginia Mack:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book especially book entitled
Dear Mom and Dad: You Don't Know Me, But ... your mind will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in each and every aspect that maybe unknown for but surely can become your mind friends.
Imaging every word written in a e-book then become one application form conclusion and explanation that
will maybe you never get prior to. The Dear Mom and Dad: You Don't Know Me, But ... giving you one
more experience more than blown away your brain but also giving you useful data for your better life in this
era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you
are finished looking at it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time
activity?

Jessica Jackson:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from the book. Book is published or printed or highlighted from each source which filled update
of news. Within this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you actually.
From media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, book and
comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or
just in search of the Dear Mom and Dad: You Don't Know Me, But ... when you needed it?
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