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A sexy Beauty and the Beast romance from contemporary romance author Julia Gabriel

A scarred and lonely billionaire hiding from his past ...

Jared Connor lost his innocence at the age of ten when his father poured gasoline around the family home
and left his two young sons to die in the flames. Now an adult, he's carefully crafted a pretend life where he
can hide his scars and his death row father behind the disguise of a caretaker's pickup truck and a pair of
gardening shears. But when a beautiful woman with scars of her own barges into his quiet, solitary life, Jared
finds it increasingly difficult to hide from what he really wants.

A successful young businesswoman ill at ease in her newfound beauty ...

Phlox Miller was never the pretty girl and no magic mascara or secret serum was ever going to change
that—not even one manufactured by her own company. When an accident at her country home burns her
face and body, she spares no expense on her recovery and plastic surgery. Now she turns heads on the street,
but can't recognize herself in the mirror—and can't convince the man she loves that he's beautiful, too.

Can two people see beyond their physical and emotional scars to find true love and lasting acceptance?
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From reader reviews:

Tammara Dejesus:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the reserve entitled Next to You. Try to stumble through book Next to You as
your pal. It means that it can to get your friend when you truly feel alone and beside associated with course
make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you
considerably more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , let's make new
experience along with knowledge with this book.

Lester Magno:

Beside this particular Next to You in your phone, it might give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge
or info. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh through the oven so don't end up being
worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have Next to You because this
book offers to your account readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you would not get
what it's about. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable blend here
cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss that? Find this
book in addition to read it from now!

Mildred Olsen:

Is it anyone who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs or
just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Next to You can be the response, oh
how comes? It's a book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this
completely new era is common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?

Louis Chavez:

E-book is one of source of know-how. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen will need book to know the change information of year for you to year. As we know those
guides have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. By
the book Next to You we can acquire more advantage. Don't that you be creative people? To be creative
person must love to read a book. Simply choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't be doubt
to change your life with this book Next to You. You can more attractive than now.
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