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"An impressive, meticulously reported postmortem. . . . The Wizard of Lies is the definitive book on
what Madoff did and how he did it." ?Bloomberg Businessweek

Who is Bernie Madoff, and how did he pull off the biggest Ponzi scheme in history?

This question has fascinated people ever since the news broke about the New York financier who swindled
his friends, relatives, and other investors out of $65 billion. And in The Wizard of Lies, Diana B. Henriques
of The New York Times has written the definitive book on the man and his scheme, drawing on
unprecedented access and more than one hundred interviews, including Bernie Madoff's first interviews for
publication since his arrest. Henriques also provides vivid details from the lawsuits and government
investigations that explode the myths that have come to surround the story, and in a revised and expanded
epilogue she unravels the latest legal developments.

A true-life financial thriller, The Wizard of Lies contrasts Madoff's remarkable rise on Wall Street with
dramatic scenes from his accelerating slide toward self-destruction. It is also the most complete account of
the heartbreaking personal disasters and landmark legal battles triggered by Madoff's downfall?the suicides,
business failures, fractured families, shuttered charities?and the clear lessons this timeless scandal offers to
Washington, Wall Street, and Main Street.
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From reader reviews:

Markus Walker:

The book The Wizard of Lies: Bernie Madoff and the Death of Trust make you feel enjoy for your spare
time. You can utilize to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to become your best friend when
you getting anxiety or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make looking at a book The
Wizard of Lies: Bernie Madoff and the Death of Trust to become your habit, you can get far more
advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. It is
possible to know everything if you like open and read a guide The Wizard of Lies: Bernie Madoff and the
Death of Trust. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or some others.
So , how do you think about this publication?

Leslie Bergeron:

This The Wizard of Lies: Bernie Madoff and the Death of Trust book is simply not ordinary book, you have
it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is actually information inside
this book incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information
you will get. This The Wizard of Lies: Bernie Madoff and the Death of Trust without we recognize teach the
one who looking at it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't become worry The Wizard of Lies:
Bernie Madoff and the Death of Trust can bring when you are and not make your case space or bookshelves'
turn into full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even telephone. This The Wizard of Lies:
Bernie Madoff and the Death of Trust having excellent arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not
really feel uninterested in reading.

Nicholas Poston:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be revise about what going on or facts even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era that is certainly always change and make progress.
Some of you maybe will certainly update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for
yourself but the problems coming to you is you don't know what one you should start with. This The Wizard
of Lies: Bernie Madoff and the Death of Trust is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the
world. Why, since this book serves what you want and need in this era.

William Glover:

This book untitled The Wizard of Lies: Bernie Madoff and the Death of Trust to be one of several books that
best seller in this year, here is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You
will easily to buy this particular book in the book retail outlet or you can order it by using online. The
publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, because you can read this
book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason for you to past this guide from your list.
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