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The use of computer vision systems to control manufacturing processes and product quality has become
increasingly important in food processing. Computer vision technology in the food and beverage industries
reviews image acquisition and processing technologies and their applications in particular sectors of the food
industry.

Part one provides an introduction to computer vision in the food and beverage industries, discussing
computer vision and infrared techniques for image analysis, hyperspectral and multispectral imaging,
tomographic techniques and image processing. Part two goes on to consider computer vision technologies for
automatic sorting, foreign body detection and removal, automated cutting and image analysis of food
microstructure. Current and future applications of computer vision in specific areas of the food and beverage
industries are the focus of part three. Techniques for quality control of meats are discussed alongside
computer vision in the poultry, fish and bakery industries, including techniques for grain quality evaluation,
and the evaluation and control of fruit, vegetable and nut quality.

With its distinguished editor and international team of expert contributors, Computer vision technology in
the food and beverage industries is an indispensible guide for all engineers and researchers involved in the
development and use of state-of-the-art vision systems in the food industry.

Discusses computer vision and infrared techniques for image analysis, hyperspectral and multispectral●

imaging, tomographic techniques and image processing
Considers computer vision technologies for automatic sorting, foreign body detection and removal,●

automated cutting and image analysis of food microstructure
Examines techniques for quality control and computer vision in various industries including the poultry,●

fish and bakery, fruit, vegetable and nut industry
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From reader reviews:

Stephen Stovall:

Now a day people who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by connect to the internet and
the resources included can be true or not require people to be aware of each details they get. How people
have to be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book.
Reading through a book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Computer
Vision Technology in the Food and Beverage Industries (Woodhead Publishing Series in Food Science,
Technology and Nutrition) book as this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the
information in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Ronald Karl:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information presently can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even an issue. What people must be
consider whenever those information which is from the former life are challenging be find than now's taking
seriously which one is acceptable to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you receive the
unstable resource then you buy it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Computer Vision Technology in the Food and
Beverage Industries (Woodhead Publishing Series in Food Science, Technology and Nutrition) as the daily
resource information.

Joyce Tower:

Computer Vision Technology in the Food and Beverage Industries (Woodhead Publishing Series in Food
Science, Technology and Nutrition) can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. We all
recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge
in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The author
giving his/her effort that will put every word into pleasure arrangement in writing Computer Vision
Technology in the Food and Beverage Industries (Woodhead Publishing Series in Food Science, Technology
and Nutrition) however doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm
resource facts that maybe you can be among it. This great information may drawn you into brand new stage
of crucial thinking.

Henry Stanton:

It is possible to spend your free time to learn this book this guide. This Computer Vision Technology in the
Food and Beverage Industries (Woodhead Publishing Series in Food Science, Technology and Nutrition) is
simple to deliver you can read it in the park, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not include
much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you much
easier to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of



benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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