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If you're not a tree lover now, this pocket-sized gem?dedicated to the idea that every species of tree has a
story and every individual tree has a history?will make you one. Produced in consultation with the City's
Parks and Recreation department and the New York Tree Trust, this book is a reference to the stories of New
York City's trees, complete with photographs, tree silhouettes, leaf and fruit morphologies, and charming and
informative explanatory texts. It is divided into four sections: "The Best Places to See Trees," full of insider's
tips and helpful maps; "New York City's Great Trees," a directory of the oldest, strangest, most beautiful
trees; "The Tree Guide," arranged for ease of identification by leaf shape and size; and, finally, "Sources and
Resources" for future investigation.

With over 700 beautiful color photographs, drawings, and detailed maps, this is the ultimate field guide to
the trees of the Big Apple and the metropolitan region.
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From reader reviews:

Rose Cordeiro:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
any time those information which is in the former life are hard to be find than now is taking seriously which
one works to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable resource then
you get it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen within you if you take New York City Trees as the daily resource information.

Deborah Ayers:

Reading a book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With examining you can get a
lot of information that could give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world may share their
idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire all their reader with their
story or their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the textbooks. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
children, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve
their expertise in writing, they also doing some research before they write on their book. One of them is this
New York City Trees.

Mary Stockton:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, about to beach, or
picnic inside park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your own free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book may be option to fill your cost-free
time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want
to try look for book, may be the reserve untitled New York City Trees can be great book to read. May be it
could be best activity to you.

Wanda Mason:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this New York City Trees book written by
well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that can be understand by anyone who have read the
book. Written throughout good manner for you, dripping every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate
your own hunger then you still doubt New York City Trees as good book not merely by the cover but also
through the content. This is one publication that can break don't evaluate book by its include, so do you still
needing one more sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already told
you so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.
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