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At Home with the Aztecs provides a fresh view of Aztec society, focusing on households and communities
instead of kings, pyramids, and human sacrifice. This new approach offers an opportunity to humanize the
Aztecs, moving past the popular stereotype of sacrificial maniacs to demonstrate that these were successful
and prosperous communities. Michael Smith also engagingly describes the scientific, logistic and personal
dimensions of archaeological fieldwork, drawing on decades of excavating experience and considering how
his research was affected by his interaction with contemporary Mexican communities. Through first-hand
accounts of the ways archaeologists interpret sites and artifacts, the book illuminates how the archaeological
process can provide information about ancient families. Facilitating a richer understanding of the Aztec
world, Smith’s research also redefines success, prosperity and resilience in ancient societies, making this
book suitable not only for those interested in the Aztecs but in the examination of complex societies in
general.
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From reader reviews:

Alma Bulger:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the book entitled At Home with the Aztecs: An Archaeologist Uncovers
Their Daily Life. Try to make book At Home with the Aztecs: An Archaeologist Uncovers Their Daily Life
as your buddy. It means that it can to get your friend when you really feel alone and beside that course make
you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you much more
confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , we should make new experience in addition to
knowledge with this book.

Trey Olivas:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they are still students or that for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that question above. Every person has diverse
personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't
wish do that. You must know how great and also important the book At Home with the Aztecs: An
Archaeologist Uncovers Their Daily Life. All type of book can you see on many resources. You can look for
the internet sources or other social media.

Shirley Arrington:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading behavior
give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge even the information inside
the book which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want truly
feel happy read one having theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The particular At Home with the
Aztecs: An Archaeologist Uncovers Their Daily Life is kind of guide which is giving the reader unforeseen
experience.

Steven Burley:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a publication will give you a lot of
new facts. When you read a e-book you will get new information simply because book is one of many ways
to share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading a book will make you more imaginative.
When you reading through a book especially fictional works book the author will bring someone to imagine
the story how the people do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other folks. When you read
this At Home with the Aztecs: An Archaeologist Uncovers Their Daily Life, you can tells your family,
friends as well as soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a



publication.
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