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Everyone of us knows someone who runs. He is one of the symp-toms of our times—from the little man who
shoves you out of the way on the street to the go-getter who shoves you out of a job in the office to the
Fuehrer who shoves you out of the world. And all of us have stopped to wonder, at some time or another,
what it is that makes these people tick. What makes them run?

This is the question Schulberg has asked himself, and the answer is the first novel written with the
indignation that only a young writer with talent and ideals could concentrate into a manuscript. It is the story
of Sammy Glick, the man with a positive genius for being a heel, who runs through New York’s East Side,
through newspaper ranks and finally through Hollywood, leaving in his wake the wrecked careers of his
associates; for this is his tragedy and his chief characteristic—his congenital incapacity for friendship.

An older and more experienced novelist might have tempered his story and, in so doing, destroyed one of its
outstanding qualities. Compromise would mar the portrait of Sammy Glick. Schulberg has etched it in pure
vitriol, and dissected his victim with a precision that is almost frightening.

When a fragment of this book appeared as a short story in a national magazine, Schulberg was surprised at
the number of letters he received from people convinced they knew Sammy Glick’s real name. But
speculation as to his real identity would be utterly fruitless, for Sammy is a composite picture of a loud and
spectacular minority bitterly resented by the many decent and sincere artists who are trying honestly to
realize the measureless potentialities of motion pictures. To this group belongs Schulberg himself, who has
not only worked as a screen writer since his graduation from Dartmouth College in 1936, but has spent his
life, literally, in the heart of the motion-picture colony. In the course of finding out what makes Sammy run
(an operation in which the reader is spared none of the grue-some details) Schulberg has poured out
everything he has felt about that place. The result is a book which the publishers not only believe to be the
most honest ever written about Hollywood, but a penetrating study of one kind of twentieth-century success
that is peculiar to no single race of people or walk of life.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Mobley:

The book What Makes Sammy Run? can give more knowledge and also the precise product information
about everything you want. Why must we leave the best thing like a book What Makes Sammy Run?? A
number of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that book can give many facts for us.
It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or details that you take for
that, it is possible to give for each other; you could share all of these. Book What Makes Sammy Run? has
simple shape but you know: it has great and big function for you. You can seem the enormous world by open
up and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Jessie Loudermilk:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important usually. The book What Makes Sammy Run? has been making you
to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what
advantages for you. The guide What Makes Sammy Run? is not only giving you much more new
information but also being your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your own personal spend
time to read your book. Try to make relationship together with the book What Makes Sammy Run?. You
never experience lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Robert Caldwell:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. That book What Makes Sammy Run? was colourful and of course
has pictures on the website. As we know that book What Makes Sammy Run? has many kinds or variety.
Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and think you are
the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it makes you feel
happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading that will.

Ann Walsh:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from your book. Book is composed or printed or illustrated from each source this filled update
of news. Within this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you. From
media social including newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book?
Or just trying to find the What Makes Sammy Run? when you essential it?
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