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A Return to Palmyra

In 1830, the Church of Jesus Christ of Latter-day Saints was established in Palmyra, New York. But within a
few short years, persecution had driven the Saints away from the Church’s birthplace. For many decades,
northwestern New York was a hostile place for a Mormon.

However, in 1915, President Joseph F. Smith felt impressed the time had come for the Church to again have
a presence there. He called Willard and Rebecca Bean to return to Palmyra.

As a former prizefighter, Willard had the temperament to withstand the unkind words and harsh treatment
they received from their neighbors, while Rebecca s kind demeanor served to create friends out of former
enemies.

As the couple s initial five-year calling stretched on for many years, they were instrumental in many key
events, such as the acquisition of the Hill Cumorah and other prominent sites.

Most importantly, their sacrifices and faithfulness opened the way for thousands of Saints to visit Palmyra in
later years and partake of the Spirit of the Lord that is there.

This is their story.
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From reader reviews:

Shawn Midkiff:

Do you among people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys this
particular aren't like that. This A Lion and A Lamb book is readable simply by you who hate the perfect
word style. You will find the info here are arrange for enjoyable reading experience without leaving perhaps
decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer connected with A Lion and A Lamb content
conveys thinking easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the
written content but it just different available as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking A Lion and A Lamb is
not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Jennifer Games:

The guide with title A Lion and A Lamb has a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of
help after read this book. This particular book exist new information the information that exist in this reserve
represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement
of the world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book
in your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Stanley Torres:

Often the book A Lion and A Lamb has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you make sure to read this book
you can get a lot of benefit. The book was compiled by the very famous author. The writer makes some
research previous to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you may get the point easily after
looking over this book.

Carol Jackson:

With this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more treasured than
other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you need to do is
just spending your time not much but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of the books in the top
record in your reading list is definitely A Lion and A Lamb. This book that is certainly qualified as The
Hungry Hills can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking upwards and review this reserve you
can get many advantages.
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