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PART ONE: Set in the not too distant future… When a 100-year global drought devastates the Earth and a
failed rainmaking experiment destroys the atmosphere, humankind teeters on the brink of collapse. As the
remaining nations wage war over dwindling water supplies and natural resources, two rival scientists on
opposite sides of the world discover a lost glacier high in the Andes - setting off a deadly race to claim and
control the planet’s last known source of fresh water. The story focuses on Aaron Turner, a brilliant
volcanologist with a secret past he’d like to keep hidden. Aaron’s known for his radical, sometimes
controversial theories and his intelligence is off the charts, but he’s trapped in the shadow of his father’s
brilliance and failures – a burden that may finally lift if Aaron reaches the buried glacier first. But a terrible
revelation awaits underground that threatens the very existence of their mission. Created by Liquid Comics
and producer Eric Eisner’s "Epic Cycle" graphic novel imprint. Written by Grant Calof (Hulk: Unchained)
with artwork by Jeevan J. Kang (Spider-Man: India; John Woo’s Seven Brothers, The Sadhu).
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From reader reviews:

Sun Byrd:

The book H2O, Issue 1 will bring you to the new experience of reading the book. The author style to spell
out the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book to see, this book very appropriate to you. The
book H2O, Issue 1 is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book from official web
site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Travis Hargrove:

The book untitled H2O, Issue 1 contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains her idea with easy
technique. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can
easy to read the item. The book was authored by famous author. The author brings you in the new period of
time of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or
product, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book,
you can open their official web-site and order it. Have a nice study.

Mohammed Strohl:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you may
have it in e-book technique, more simple and reachable. This H2O, Issue 1 can give you a lot of pals because
by you considering this one book you have matter that they don't and make an individual more like an
interesting person. That book can be one of a step for you to get success. This reserve offer you information
that might be your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than additional make you to be great persons.
So , why hesitate? We need to have H2O, Issue 1.

Frances Pierce:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by internet on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is named of
book H2O, Issue 1. You can add your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it might add
your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware about reserve. It
can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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