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The Presidency has always been an implausible?some might even say an impossible?job. Part of the problem
is that the challenges of the presidency and the expectations Americans have for their presidents have
skyrocketed, while the president's capacity and power to deliver on what ails the nations has diminished.
Indeed, as citizens we continue to aspire and hope for greatness in our only nationally elected office. The
problem of course is that the demand for great presidents has always exceeded the supply. As a result,
Americans are adrift in a kind of Presidential Bermuda Triangle suspended between the great presidents we
want and the ones we can no longer have.

The End of Greatness explores the concept of greatness in the presidency and the ways in which it has
become both essential and detrimental to America and the nation's politics. Miller argues that greatness in
presidents is a much overrated virtue. Indeed, greatness is too rare to be relevant in our current politics, and
driven as it is by nation-encumbering crisis, too dangerous to be desirable.

Our preoccupation with greatness in the presidency consistently inflates our expectations, skews the debate
over presidential performance, and drives presidents to misjudge their own times and capacity. And our
focus on the individual misses the constraints of both the office and the times, distorting how Presidents
actually lead. In wanting and expecting our leaders to be great, we have simply made it impossible for them
to be good. The End of Greatness takes a journey through presidential history, helping us understand how
greatness in the presidency was achieved, why it's gone, and how we can better come to appreciate the
presidents we have, rather than being consumed with the ones we want.
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From reader reviews:

Paul McKinney:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them loved ones
or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you can
read any book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent the
entire day to reading a publication. The book The End of Greatness: Why America Can't Have (and Doesn't
Want) Another Great President it is rather good to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this
book. These people were enjoying reading this book. If you did not have enough space bringing this book
you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this book from the smart phone. The
price is not too costly but this book features high quality.

Morris Reyna:

You may spend your free time to study this book this publication. This The End of Greatness: Why America
Can't Have (and Doesn't Want) Another Great President is simple to create you can read it in the recreation
area, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not include much space to bring typically the printed
book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save the book in your
smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Effie Morris:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we would like. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year
ended up being exactly added. This reserve The End of Greatness: Why America Can't Have (and Doesn't
Want) Another Great President was filled concerning science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge
about your technology competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading some sort of book. If
you know how big good thing about a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era
like now, many ways to get book you wanted.

Sharon Brogdon:

E-book is one of source of expertise. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen have to have book to know the revise information of year for you to year. As we
know those publications have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can bring us to
around the world. From the book The End of Greatness: Why America Can't Have (and Doesn't Want)
Another Great President we can acquire more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? To become
creative person must choose to read a book. Just choose the best book that suited with your aim. Don't be
doubt to change your life with that book The End of Greatness: Why America Can't Have (and Doesn't
Want) Another Great President. You can more pleasing than now.
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