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Like the city in which it was born 100 years ago, the Philadelphia Orchestra is known for its classy elegance
- a sophisticated polish that is impressive without being brash or showy. But in addition to the lush string
sound and piquant winds and brass for which the Orchestra has become famous, the "Fabulous
Philadelphians" were also pioneers in American musical life in this century. Lavishly illustrated with more
than 200 photos and engagingly written by twelve prominent writers, The Philadelphia Orchestra: A Century
of Music offers the first full history of this great orchestra's tradition and legacy. Premieres of essential
masterworks by Sibelius, Mahler, Stravinsky, Rachmaninoff, Schoenberg. The first orchestra to make
electrical recordings, in 1925, and the first to appear on a full-length national radio broadcast. The first
American orchestra to visit China The orchestra of Disney's Fantasia. With wit and scholarship, twelve
writers celebrate the 100th anniversary of this world-renowned orchestra by detailing the rich musical history
of Philadelphia, as well as the traditions of the Orchestra's music directors, Fritz Scheel, Carl Pohlig,
Leopold Stokowski, Eugene Ormandy, Riccardo Muti, and Wolfgang Sawallisch. They take us to rehearsals
and concerts, recording studios and tours, boardrooms and inner-city schools. The Philadelphia Orchestra: A
Century of Music also introducts us to the musicians and the Orchestra supporters who have built the
ensemble's international stature. It examines the Orchestra's innovative educational programs, fundraisers,
and membership drives. This elegant keepsake book also features appendices listing the Orchestra's
musicians through its entire history, world and U.S. premieres, and a complete discography and filmography.
It is an essential collector's item for music-lovers everywhere, and an electrifying "read" for anyone
interested in music in America during the 20th century. Author note: John Ardoin is former music critic for
the Dallas Morning News and author of The Callas Legacy, Callas at Julliard: The Master Classes, The
Stages of Menotti, The Furtwungler Record, and Kirov: Life in a Great Theater.
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From reader reviews:

Joshua Johnson:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a reserve you will get new information due to the fact book is one of several
ways to share the information as well as their idea. Second, examining a book will make an individual more
imaginative. When you studying a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to definitely
imagine the story how the character types do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to some
others. When you read this The Philadelphia Orchestra: A Century of Music, you may tells your family,
friends and soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a e-book.

Richard Simpson:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world could share their
idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their own reader with their story
or maybe their experience. Not only the story that share in the guides. But also they write about the
information about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on this planet always try to
improve their ability in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write with their book. One of
them is this The Philadelphia Orchestra: A Century of Music.

Louise Perez:

The book The Philadelphia Orchestra: A Century of Music has a lot info on it. So when you read this book
you can get a lot of gain. The book was published by the very famous author. The writer makes some
research before write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you will get the point easily after
looking over this book.

Jamie Harper:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the free time or they will get lots of
stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely
indeed. People is human not just a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity do you have when
the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer can unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading books. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the particular book you have read is
usually The Philadelphia Orchestra: A Century of Music.
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